ﬁf‘

LU o Heieh farsmT
Figul WET-RieTs o Hgish (Ha=, TERTe 399 qut g wEied
AGHEAT, T UITMHHTT FARA, e qa T\, qut %22 003

SUeA 3h.0%0 -REIRICRE -9 :- doS.igro@igrmaharashtra.gov.in
1.5, Sh1.Y/HETH - ¥ /.56, 3000 /0%%/ (22 fEieh- 20 R0/30R%.
i,

?) WIS 3T ()
) AR (He)

o .- IR FRET UASOEES! R U= /ol
FHIUTTE.

Y ;- ) 1.3 R AR GSUIS A SiHted daeht shHish
¢ /R0 T AT STTRT,
R) HERTSZ ¥ITEH, Fegel d 9 [aoTTehelet STt 3. 931
R00Y¥/REI/MFHYIE/H-L [§.08/019/00%,
3) HERT ITE IS0 STATIRT shHTeR 9 3.2 /20/30R%.

IURIeR G 3F.Q AT AR STHIEd ITraehT W /038 Hed HI.3Td 1T,
TATA TSR SIS AT WTATTHIOT YT hetodT ST,

All the Government authorities have to take effective steps to implement the

notification and to make the authoritics and the public aware. It is also the duty of the
authoritics to implement the notification in its truc letter and spirit, so that unnccessary
burden on the citizens would be avoided. Needless to state that, the exercise shall be donc
by the state government throughout the State of bringing it to the notice of all the
Government departments and the authoritics accepting affidavits and declaration not to

insist upon the stamp duty.

W%.QWWWWW/W/WW/W
THUYS [/ ULEcT THOYS HaauaEe a g ITEaE fEed Jhaar g



Admin
Stamp


-+

. FOOEE I 99 UERE WOsTiEer. MR el S STgE-g weiet

\

heTAXt;k\
FTT-¥ T HTHRO AN STHeTe! Haioh I[oeh HIt shel Te.

Geof 6.3 378 HERTSE Heieh ATuTTaare aRfvrs - ush mefier sTiesamed gurun
FOATT HTEAT ST ST HHI® ¥, 4, ¢, §, 9, 30, 3¢, ¥¥, 4o, 4R, 4¢ T §.200/-
fohal %.300/- TaST %.400/- HEIeh Y[oeh ShLUATT 1ol 31Te.

Aq1.3%0 AT, TUIS B! ISR I G5 6.2 ° STRSIER I
T FARTas |G AT AT RS TEIhTaT STTE e 99 3T T Fo-T 04T
ATeAedT R, T 3-Tel hged ATRITehg ¥l el HiaeusmaE! & Qoo/- o
Wrg YO AATOT R STEAT. feHi 2% /20/R0% o WTHA (UAER 3-JaT sharaed
TETHRIFGT FU Yoo/~ o T YU HFTON shefl ST TTeard  (HI9M 31et 3Te.
I FHAA THT FTAARTHR JREe ST AUT=aT Fe WehReaT Tidaa=Te] qgish
3[oeh A1 holol ST I GSuid STl THUcTarelt 3aeie! SUaarie SRt o

TEHIER FHT AFIGI Hvamd 7.
%Mml
TNt WO (| L)
e - He o #ﬂﬂﬂ%ﬁﬂ%awﬁuﬂa

RIS T ot


Admin
Stamp


AK

AK

0

1 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt

IN THE HIGH COURT OF JUDICATURE AT BOMBAY
BENCH AT AURANGABAD

PUBLIC INTEREST LITIGATION NO. 58 OF 2021

Bhushan Ishwar Mahajan .. Petitioner
Versus
The State of Maharashtra and others .. Respondents

Ms. P S. Talekar, Advocate h/f M/s. Talekar and Associates, for the
Petitioner.
Mr. A. R. Kale, AGP for Respondent Nos. 1 to 4.

CORAM : S.V. GANGAPURWAIA &
R. N. LADDHA, JJ.
DATED : 11% October, 2021.

PER COURT:-

The present public interest litigation is filed secking following
reliefs :

A) To direct the respondents, their subordinates, officers,
agents to strictly implement the notification dated 01.07.2004
issued by the Revenue and Forest Department, Mantralaya,
Mumbai, wherein it is held by the State Government that the
stamp duty chargeable under Article 4 of Schedule I of the
Maharashtra Stamp Act, 1958 for the purposes of Affidavits to
be used for any purposes has been remitted under Section 9 of
the said Act, by issuing a writ of mandamus, or any other

appropriate writ, order or direction as the case may be;

B) To direct the respondents their subordinates, officers,
agents to display in their offices/public offices at conspicuous

place that ‘as per notification dated 01.07.2004 the stamp duty

l1ol9



Admin
Stamp


2 97-PIL 58-2021.odt

chargeable under the Maharashtra Stamp Act, 1958 for the
purposes of Affidavits to be used for any purposes has been
remitted by issuing a writ of mandamus, or any other

appropriate writ, order or direction as the case may be;

Q) To direct the respondents to give wide publicity to the
notification dated 01.07.2004 issucd by the Revenue and Forest
Department, Mantralaya, Mumbai, pending hearing and final

disposal of this petition.

D) To direct the respondents, their subordinates, officers,
agents not to insist any person to pay stamp duty under the
Maharashtra Stamp Act, 1958 for the purposes of Affidavits to
be used for any purposes, pending hearing and final disposal of

this petition;

E) To grant any other relief to which the petitioner is

entitled to.

2. Ms. Talekar, learned counsel for the petitioner submits that in
spite of the fact that notification has been issueci on 01.07.2004 by the
State Government under Section 9 of the Maharashtra Stamp Act, 1958
(hereinafter referred to as ‘Act of 1958’) remitting the stamp duty
chargeable under Article 4 of Schedule I of the Act of 1958 for the
purpose of affidavit, the departments of the State Government are
insisting for affidavits either on Rs. 100/- stamp paper or on Rs. 500/-
stamp paper consistently. The same is in flagrant violation of the
remission granted by the State Government. The departments of the

State cannot insist for affidavit on a stamp paper.

20f9



Admin
Stamp


3 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt

84 The learned counsel for the petitioner to buttress her submissions
relies on the tender documents of the Public Works Department to
contend that now the Public Works Department is insisting for affidavit
on Rs. 500/- stamp paper. The learned counsel also has referred to
other illustrations to submit that in all Government departments, the

affidavits are insisted on stamp papers.

4. Mr. Kale, learned A.G.P submits that the State Government
invoking its powers under Section 9 of the Act of 1958 has granted
remission from payment of stamp duty on affidavits as envisaged under
Article 4 of the Act of 1958. The State machinery has already instructed
to all the Deputy Commissioners, District Collectors as well as all the
authorities concerned informing issuance of resolution and instructed
them for non insistence of the stamp papers. The authorities have also
taken care to give wide publicity through posters as well as through
news items. The steps are taken for public awareness of the issuance of
notification granting remission of stamp duties for affidavits. The
copies of news items and the relevant posters are also annexed with the
affidavit in reply. The learned A.G.B further submits that the Joint
District Registrar, Aurangabad has filed affidavit that the authorities
have also taken care to give wide publicity through poster as well as
through news items and further granting remission of stamp duties for

30f9


Admin
Stamp


4 97-PIL 58-2021.odt
the affidavits. The learned A.G.P further submits that the notification
granting remission of stamp duty for affidavit is also published on the

Website.

5. The Act of 1958 is enacted to consolidate and amend the law
relating to stamps and stamp duties in the State of Maharashtra. The
same is adopted and modified by the Maharashtra Adaptation of Laws
(State and Concurrent Subjects) Order, 1960. Article 4 of Schedule I of
the Act of 1958 provides that affidavit that is to say, a statement in
writing purporting to be a statement of facts, signed by the person
making it and confirmed by him on oath or in the case of persons by
law allowed to affirm or declare instead of swearing, by affirmation is
required to be on a stamp paper of Rs. 100/-. Article 4 grants

exemption to certain specific affidavits.

6. Section 9 of the Act of 1958 empowers the State Government to
reduce or remit, whether prospectively or retrospectively, in the whole
or any part of the State the duties with which any instruments or any
particular class of instruments or any of the instruments belonging to
such class, or any instruments when executed by or in favour of any
particular class of persons, or by or in favour of any members of such

class, are chargeable.

40f9


Admin
Stamp


®

7 Invoking Section 9 of the Act of 1958, the State Government

5 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt

under notification dated 01.07.2004 remitted the stamp duty
chargeable under Article 4 of schedule I appended to the said Act, on
the instruments of affidavit or the declaration made for obtaining caste
certificate/income certificate/domicile certificate/nationality certificate
or for any other purpose of being filed or used before any Government

authority or in any Court or before the officer of any Court.

8. The notification dated 01.07.2004 thereby remits the stamp duty
on the instruments of affidavit or declaration for being used before any
Government authority or in any Court or before the officer of any

Court.

9. The notification is explicitly clear. No Government authority can
insist for affidavit on a stamp paper. The Government, it appears was
aware that its authorities are not abiding by the notification dated
01.07.2004 as such, issued a circular on 12.05.2015 directing not to
insist for affidavits on stamp paper. It appears from the information
provided under the Right to Information Act that Rs. 100/- stamps arc

used for non judicial purposes on a large scale.

10. It appears that Suo Moto Public Interest Litigation No. 121 of

2014 was registered at the Principal Seat of this Court on the basis of

5 uf 9


Admin
Stamp


6 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt
the news item published in Mumbai Mirror on 10.07.2014, “Mystery
Shortage of Rs. 100/- Stamp Papers”. In the said Public Interest
Litigation the affidavit was filed by the Additional Controller of Stamps.
Paragraph No. 4 and 6 of the affidavit are reproduced by the Court in
its judgment dated 28.03.2016 in Public Interest Litigation No. 121 of

2014. The same reads thus :

4] In the aforesaid affidavit, Additional Controller of
Stamps has denied that there was any shortage of stamp papers
of the denomination of Rs. 100 in the month of July 2014, or
for that matter at present. Further, he has pointed out that the
State in exercise of powers conferred upon it by clause (a) of
section 9 of the Maharashtra Stamp Act, 1958 has issued
notification dated 1 July 2014 remitting the stamp duty
chargeable under section 4 of schedule I appended to the said
Act, on the instruments of affidavit or declaration made for
obtaining caste certificates, income certificates, domicile
certificates and nationality certificates. As such, he has
submitted that there is no necessity for purchase of any stamp
paper for the aforesaid purpose. Mr. G. W. Mattos, the
Government Pleader has submitted that in view of such
notification, there are hardly any purposes, for which, the
students seeking admission to educational institutions are

required to purchase stamp papers.

5] That apart, the Additional Controller of Stamps at
paragraphs 6, 7 and 8 of his affidavit has made the following

statements :
“6.  Isay that the Government in the Revenue and Forest

60f9


Admin
Stamp


7 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt

Department vide a Circular dated 14™ October, 2014
granted Stamp Vending licenses to Bar Associations for sale
of Stamp Papers and Court Fee Labels in Court premises. |
say that my office has issued Stamp Vending Licenses to the
Dadar Bar Association, the Bombay Advocates Bar
Association at the Small Causes Court, Mumbai, The Motor
Accident Claim Tribunal Bar Association, The Borivali
Advocates Bar Associations, the Advocates Associates of
Western India, The Mazagaon Court Bar Association at
Esplanade Court, Mumbai. However, the Advocates
Association of Western India has not yet commenced the
sale of Stamp Papers and Court Fee Labels inter alia on
account of some administrative difficulties. I say that my
office has also issued a Stamp Vending License to The
Indian Advocates Multi State Multi Purpose Co-operative
Society Ltd. situate in the High Court premises as per the
permission granted by the Government in the Revenue and
Forest Department vide its letter dated 26™ November;

2014.

7. I say that it is made compulsory to fill the form in
Annexure 1 for obtaining Stamp Papers for executing
Affidavits and the form in Annexure 2 for executing
documents other than Affidavits as per the Circular dated
14"  August, 2014 issued by Inspector General of
Registration, Maharashtra State, Pune. The specimen copies
of the said Annexures are hereto annexed and marked as
EXHIBITS 2’ and ‘3’ respectively. I say that for completing
these formalities it takes some time, which some times
results into long queues of people at the Stamp Vending

Centres.

0

7019


Admin
Stamp


8 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt

8. I say that in Mumbai and Mumbai Suburban District
there are 24 Government approved license Stamp Vendors. I
say that as per the demand of the said Stamp Vendors,
supply of stamp papers and Court Fee labels is being
arranged by my office regularly. Hence, there is no scarcity
of stamp papers. I say that with a view to keep a check inter
alia on the sale of stamp papers by Stamp Vendors,
instructions are issued to all Collectors of Stamps in
Mumbai and Mumbai Suburban District by my office to
carry out periodic inspections of the licensed Stamp Vendors
premises so as to inter alia ensure that the persons

intending to purchase Stamp Papers are not overcharged.”

11. The said affidavit also clarified the stand of the State that

remission on stamp paper for the affidavit is provided for.

12. (The officers of the Government are required to be imparted with

‘the necessary knowledge of the notification published by the State

Government remitting the stamp duty. Though it is submitted that time
to time news items are published,ron the website also the same is
published, still the fact remains that the affidavit on stamp papers are
insisted upon by the Government Departments and also on the

documents to be used before the Court.

13. The Government may take further steps such as holding
workshops for the officers and the authorities and/or such steps so as
to bring it to the notice of all concerned that they shall not insist for

8of9


Admin
Stamp


®

9 97-PIL 58-2021.0dt
affidavits on stamp paper. The notification has to be brought in effect in
reality and the same shall not remain only on papers. The order dated
08.01.2015 issued by the State Election Commission also it seems is
flouted. The State Election Commission on 08.01.2015 had issued an
order that the affidavit and declaration shall not be insisted on the
stamp paper, but still the same is accepted on stamp paper during the
process of elections. All the Government authorities have to take
effective steps to implement the notification and to make the
authorities and the public aware. It is also the duty of the authorities to
implement the notification in its true letter and spirit, so that
unnecessary burden on the citizens would be avoided. Needless to state
that, the exercise shall be done by the State Government throughout
the State of bringing it to the notice of all the Government departments
and the authorities accepting affidavits and declaration not to insist

upon the stamp duty.

14. Public interest litigation is disposed of. No costs.

(R.N.LADDHA) ( S. V. GANGAPURWALA )
JUDGE JUDGE

PS.B.

9o0f9


Admin
Stamp


ST, W, quy s d, Srdiea/vu-303/vadtamg/o03-oy

2
HERTE ST A9
witiga WHTTA

THATY, GA 9, J00H/HTATT 90, WH 9]

| ]

T HaTer O WS YOSt W 9T A g i faer s,

H 9dIR-9
BN WEAA RERie ARFAya=A wun I (v v, go-o sfey g
v. 7w oftrg Ba Aoy 3 ardw grafaRe) Faw a am,

L GGEER-ERLE I
HyTera, Uk woo 033, A 4 A oy

amen
Yt g aRfEw, )ye.

R qEiE. 008/IIG/A. B YIYH-9. T JRIE AP, 994¢ (s84¢ @ ug
{0) TS WEH QW WS (¥) EN WETY WA WA FGARIY AR w6
Areftaran T o Amee iR afl WEll geEe Ny O UER
T T/ AT AR WA RIS e Pefionrand) aie
arerT FraTE AR WIRMHR SRS FTAA FR wd qwiven qREIEER,
I s s 1 o FTOT ¢ Woal pReAEig IS R g
e T IR,

HRRISTY TSUYTe redt ARNFEER 8 9

W, q. was,
. TRy wfg,
. ; {438)
W AR - e | et —ud 3 00 |
o

et


Admin
Stamp


‘.

—

i
theTAXtalk™ , | ‘ |

teb eunak worak ol

Juswuleaon o3 Alwjeraag Japuf)
‘dAVAVL 'S '€

‘RJJYSRIUYRIY JO JOULIACY) A1) JO ATIBU ay3 UT puE lepio Ag

10jy J0 Wno) Aue ul 1o Aoy ny JuemuUIbAND
fuw o40joq posn o po[y Auwpg jo egodind Joyo Auw Joj Jo @WIGNLUTY
A uuonup eIy RIed o[I0lWog A EaYLI) DWeAUYMBIYNIE] WELD
ﬂ Suilie3qo Joj OPRID LOIEJIB|IBP J0 JLABPLFE Jo FjuownUgsuf 8y uo 0y
35 ,pres oy 03 popuoddn | o[npuipg e je p e@IMe Jopun o[qualiyyo Lup
dureye o1 Mpuind £qodoy ‘goloqul s1qnd oy ot oR op 07 AIUERQIOU 8 3}
18y PAYSNER fugaRry LML VEIEYERY JO JUOWILLIAGT) By (8981 30 X' "Wod)
goe1 ‘v dweig Aequio

giomod O} JO OSLIEXD

“4n07) AUU JO J83LJ0 Ay} 8

uj—"1-Wogy H O/9Ee1/¥002 HuulpnN ‘ON
"BGET "IV dWYLE AVEWO(

12p10

pO0Z AInf 18T oY1 PP ‘ZE0 0¥ QI ‘DASRNUEN
J ANV INNIATY

JNAWIATVIA 818AN0.

pifa i) 3tbb @ik “ob Rinur/Acet b G " ‘Ebiol R B0M b

A=
¥
¢

g oy} Jo 6 UopoeR jo (D) BN Aq pauapuca

— .



Admin
Stamp


e A it
TR NS ":“..“7_"-.:.—

i —_—

\ ¥

D

HHT- WlehUT/0LW/ITM-3/3/ GO
o Y 9 it SEeHeTd, HEN I,
' YT T, ¢ & HeTHT, ¥ 19 S,
g I e, T (), Had-woo o4l
; ﬁﬂfﬁf:—o?q}e,ll?@?ﬂ : o !

forea:- «yrea wrateR 2 =T e Wi e w7
WHERET WfTmsmR aucs quid e WIE FHoaEa
Hod:- %) e & & R v e iR WAL,
fEA:-23 1, 3024,

9 ﬁu’rmfavmrﬁwm.ﬁﬁni-zotw.m?u/afr-ma.
fea (-0 TEET, R024

e @ 7 fawrren srie Rreaitea e .4 e aReEET W 8 TERIS e
TATY, 9 GR-A  FREEN Rovoweoy  HiEA mr M wnm  wHrEEwiEE!
: www.mﬁhadcs.mnhamsbtra.gov.in U1 FHARGBTT FTAA A TR, /I A Ao A5

Tirar ot epreteTe e, o

hY

R IR £
I HYTAS (HITEH),
a4 § wiftms! gare=Ted,
R |
2 LEEE Y F HifeT W, oY

2. W AT (), 374 & Wi, Terer e, 1as

3. T T (W), /e G SRt 3 9 wifers gueer, geg

. TEEETE, MR SRier, e & St W (Fe). -

o S ERER), /S TR S ok e S, g

. T ST, 37e S R Feerd, S (). Ll
memﬁﬁzmﬁ TR PIRdeliet Fe e e

. ‘mmwmﬁ"“


Admin
Stamp


S

—
ﬁ{r/AXta}* N | | i
T — e
q i ) - =0 B [ e R e :,-e- "."'*4.4\‘ i ,
rAS TOI Y UOW] DEKY [
3/a/ 2024 i
19 AEHE FREGE T TSR
-%o 5 ArEITERER AES SYAATET T
\S ¥d yerR=n ARSTTEER
\r.\ TR
2 IS g s A
? - wEgsIEfeTn ; f
TATHY, §u§-%00 033, : '

TR RIS HAS-AR1E 094/7.5.999/- 8
fEi®- 93 A, 209y > i
e wEYe @ 79 Ry e s . qRIT-2008( 16 IH/R. T .¥IE -9, f¥.09 i
%,?DDH, - ' ' ‘

e s R Ry — /
mmﬁaﬁwmmmﬁammawmmm
Wmﬁmmwgmaﬁﬁmﬂmmﬁwhm L
T T T 3 o8, S s e e 3 gt P, o aren i

www.igrmaharashtra.gov.in I1 H&RUBTAIR SUe3a oMY, A7 AT maBY Wﬁ"m’h‘qa 1
q BT~ BTEBRTO T 21 adflrey ame,

r.._-——'-__.-_‘_k‘-.‘__._._.I—'———I_.‘_

°|
'm______________'__,_.__-—___,\&m i
" 1

ROTAIH S4B (a80-58-2.095)



Admin
Stamp


mwmawmmmwmm
. 7S N SANE FEwer, feurasraemeraR, qor-1.
LA FHD - 020 26123826

-----------------

. HT-5/NHTATH-58/2021/5 70 /21 fe. /6/11/2021

ufa,
A1, fasmeta Hg#d TJT, AT,

fwg - e sdeTE sfRArEEd ®w duwdr Aol A
FIUaTad,
SN - 1. A I AR HeTEE @€ g Seted
i FAE /00 aUT FTATIE HER,
2.W%m,wam%mm¢pﬂ
. AETE 2004/1663/9.%.436/7-1 f&. 01/07/2004

Rugifdg el ®@ed & 1 T yRAawad  AARd ATEH
58/2021 #. Ivd ~arged, HROMEE @Idle TRl WIETAYATOT g«
Foredl Hed.

All the Government authorities have to take effective steps to
implement the notification and to make the authorities and the public
i It is alsc the duty of the authorities to implement the nohfsc_atlon
;wiiléefrue letter and spirit, so that unnecessary burden on the dcmzegs

voided. Needless to state that, the exercise shall be done by
Y ?‘ vernment throughout the State of bringing it to _the no‘tlce of
lheﬂ?taéeouj;'nment departments and the authorities accepting affidavits
all the

nd declaration not to insist upon the stamp duty.
a

e, FRATEIE GSEG ATl aUE HIRAAR AR

_3'1;'7?.'['_::-1 < ' | :

WFT WWWWWHWWWWWN

h mﬁﬂﬁwﬁﬁaﬁ.ﬁaﬁa«—ﬂﬁzmem
2

: Hégn?aﬂ QAT ATENTT Fratedr @ STy mm-&ma
et ST AEE YR A ded HR.
= Hud T il )
o Jom=A

Mef-1l05 [grocgrmanarae-hrea oo


Admin
Stamp


FCHTE Nura NOFES Fdleain FeoaE ©€ PRI A
e - R o vara adr & %_4’?
F O A A FFah qft 22

TEa=- 1 = 3T T 4 ~d Miengig wis RS -\o 58
OF 2021 e Fargfaviaral 95

2 FTTS 7RSS, =eae d dn fasrmedid HUETA
A |

F Tzie 2004/1663.F 436/=-1 & 0107:200¢
)

E”’L«’{ "
Rt SR e !
a7 ol wrEivE AU s Hfvens
(FTUTET) 7 T tfv?



Admin
Stamp


vty
e~
TRt Gitn i o

izoit wET-Riers o qgich Hawe, FERTE ed g0 g e
TSHHSAT, T WIS T AR, faerm= wer |ai,qut ¥22 0o
A 3. 00 - REOURY IR -0 :- doS.igro@maharashtra.gov.in

S5 L. /ETER - /H5.300/30%%/ (, €€ [R0%% feTe- 9.20.303.
ufd,

1) 39X gk f-aere,
2) e FieoT IuFET-RIeTS o i U=,

IER:HEREIIEAL
fore <~ WS HEie STt aRfv U HHier SgeRiTde
FUROTETE.

W — HERTS YA AU JHTIRIT % 93 13.14/10/2024.

Wmﬁﬂﬁmwwaﬁwqﬁﬁm@mawﬁ
TOT SFTUATA 3T 375 &1 f.2%/20/03y TSIeaT WSTuTes Uiaes vl 31 &Te.

&1 ST FafavaTd A WY, Held ST SYed] HiieaRad eiel ard ol shidee ad
TrafeuaT I .

Hied- ILCTTHTIT (3T FZI)

qxieh 1fgerer (qEaerd) 1.4



Admin
Stamp


RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/35530

ad go, 3F 0(3)] AHaw, ATFET 0¥, 03%/3MMVET 3, TWH R¥E [y ¥, fFwWa v 300

IETURUT THHE ¥\9

e TeRTIT

wEnTY, faurHEeT afufran @ Tl gEia Fed HERy @ e fatem,
STFHHIOTRT

i)
FA 30%¥ W1 UENTE ARY FAMEH R.— WENTZ Heieh SMUl-wHmel ol §oRen HvanTer %%
AT

HEgd 9 a9 [T
Hag ¥oo o3, faiik ¢y afidiE R0R¥,
MAHARASHTRA ORDINANCE No. XII OF 2024.
AN ORDINANCE

FURTHER TO AMEND THE MAHARASHTRA STAMP ACT.
WA 0% AT WERTE START FHIE LR,
NI WEiw  sfufaamed smorelt geRon wRuarETet st
WRue afor sarell, A AYe feEn WA, TN g stufE A s garen
RO FRUTHIET HERTETAT TSI Alehles el XUl AN sTavas = arel ufieed:
it TR S A Tl R

T AT %9 —2


Admin
Stamp


77—

HERTE YTHA T 3Tl Wi =, SFIT 0¥, R0%% /A ]R3, TR ¥R
—raret, STTAT, ST AR S R e @y (R) 7N WA e e

T FEA, FERTR TS, AR, R R yEalE g Ed -

wiera AT A Q. (1) AT SRV, WEETZ WEw (YHRN) AR, 0¥, Y T,

oy, . . .
() @, aFes FHed AL
@ R4 T 2. TERTE HEiw atufeE sreeed S T e, — s
EE el - - : n s vy . “ . - R,
FHTE Ge (2) 3q:j‘r-f-§a k.4 HEI,‘Q?T'LT (Q) YT, PIRSE A2 [3 B1 W: Yl w9
e S & AT JIEe 0A A
T (2) s v W, s (9) W, SO (%) e, T () e, e e

o7 AepAEST, (IR T 1 AEET {IEd S BECEE

(3) =T ¢ WA, @I (R) mefter, “yiee wET G AeTEAst T, “orEwt B
7 TSTER grEel A A

(%) FTHR % e, W@ () wde, T & A geEEs, et w7
71 WY el I A5

(W) T %o WA, W () HHI, “Lo 00 000 TUHTE FHHTE HAGET FYTH,
W eEeTER T, AR, AT W WigAArT 0.} TR " 7 TR, U
FrA wUgTen wue TAe S, Wi qTEEEiE Topay, Fafeadt, am@E W
SreaeTET 0.3 ZHR @ TS G@e SAA A

(7)) 3R R O, T H[HT @A FIA IEH —

* R, faren, ®m, qE AR
(37) TER HGTHTRN Gl SEOR ST v A wE (F) F
STEEFOTEER S STHRUGET 3R
feers 91eh.
() () sier, Frareame frer e B o f i RO o
affveR T S
(Zr) e, Frareamna et T g AR iy T
TR, T oE TTaier feeeen THUTAT o4 T
FEr S THA

AT
(dF) ==, 1 faeredt T 9 O A R GRS
TR, UTE ST TUETE frarEn freedT TERON o34 TR

HTm IRyl deiud ST,


Admin
Stamp


‘

AXtalk

HERTE VITAA AU AW U7 9F, AFET 0¥, 03%/AM¥a" R, WF 1’3%%
(10) 3= o ", wY () FHier, * ¥R TEter " oar wergast, “arE
sunter’ & HET JIEH H0a AL

(¢) e 3o T, w@iw () wdfier, " o vd " a1 Aergpedash, et w
e FE ST A 4

(R) 3BT 3¢ 79, WY () Wi, * v wwd 7 gy werpwast, ‘o e
7 T SEe A A5

(20) 3F=T w¥ WeA, WY () THl, 6 shver wrdl Py PP
71 TSR qMEE HUAR A

() DR ¥e we, g8 (1) wie, 3@ (F) T, W () wE, 1 g

7R 7 A AeEmEst, ¢ o e TR e A g
(33) % ¥] W, T () weler, “ ¥iE v 7 A Hepes, (o eed”
7 Ao P AT A5
(23)ﬁ%ﬁqom,ﬁu(%mﬁﬂ,“ﬁwmﬁ”mwﬁa@ﬁ,“Wmﬁ"
BT HSTHY S HUART AT
(W)aa?@?r(«?mﬁ@s(a:r)mﬂc——rmﬁ(?)mﬁ et o
wogREST, ¢ uee $UE 7§ HeTR STEe Hodn de

(%)Nﬁr‘ﬁﬁt«/mm(a)uﬁﬂw(e)m CEee v oA

TeTeTEsT, ¢ TE B T 81 Heie Jrae A A5

(3%) =T €3 Wl —
(u) e (31) miie, =9 () 74, “ @1 W@ " A Aehest, (ue o
& SR S FR0AT A5
(3R) de (F) e, —
(&) w9 (}) 78, * @1 @@ A ASIEAEs, O o g A
@A FAOGTT TSHA
(@) wia (3) W, " <ET o TOETET TR 0.8 T AT e,
T T SUEe (EHAT 0.3 THRE @ TR QP HIOAT gEe.

“"


Admin
Stamp


w HERTE VITEA WU SRR 9T 9w, aifaTET 2%, J0%¥/MMTET %R, Tk RR¥E P
fraes

T Yo g wwammmmﬁrwwmmﬁmq@#
Wﬁqﬂmmﬁ:ﬁw(zwcmau)wﬁsﬁmaﬁﬁﬁwﬂnhﬁwmﬁﬁmﬁw
2. S SRR ST U e Aees] TEEEm Aed -
(TF) HTHT ¥,4.CR,%9,30,3¢, %% ¥, 40 43, & 4e A HAGE oo e
s Vel TOd T EOEAER 9% O ;
GRREREERT w9t T ot S e e e e
TEeRTeAT I @ A Yehreal AT A HERH A6 S
() R 9<MWWW4WWTTWWW
(AR ¥l ST Yo 99 Fafafoe Seteat Tig TEREPAT TEBUTE ST ST
e, o o0o0 TATEA U HTHET FWEAI, WITERITAT HelgErict HEi YFwhie] ST
FHA TAET AE FO0
(arT) s &3 B fafee st FIEETZTE HoTEERie Haieh Yeehredl 2
:WWWWWWW
3 o PSS WETE sfusRT =] R anf S e AR AR
WﬂESTT*WHTﬁW@WIWWWA* T} AT FEATEl O, s
ST T S TR aifiea SR I W e 1, O A FEARY FE

T3, €r. df. IUEHEWT,
femiar O 3EET RORY. TR TEHTe.
T e AT SIER A
YT FEW,

P AT T WiEA

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING. STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION. PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR.
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD.
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMEN’ i 3 STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS.
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD. MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR. RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



Admin
Stamp


RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

ad go, 3 R ()] AR, dfEeiET 0¥, 0%%/IMFEAT R, IE R¥E gD ¥, A w9 Re.00

AETERUT HHE 9%
I AHTIH
RIS fuEresR AW @ Tsaure TEniE $erd AR 4 heid fafs anfr
R 7 =mr femreea st Rdad (oot erars).

In pursuance of clause (3 of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Stamp (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024 (Mah. Ord. XII of 2024), is

hereby published under the authority of the Governor.
By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

[Translation in English of the Maharashtra Stamp (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024 (Mah. Ord.
XII of 2024), published under the authority of the Governor|.

REVENUE AND FORESTS DEPARTMENT
Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, dated the 14th October 2024.

MAHARASHTRA ORDINANCE No. XII OF 2024.
AN ORDINANCE

further to amend the Maharashtra Stamp Act.

WHEREAS, both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session;

AND, WHEREAS, the Governor of Maharashtra is satisfied that
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
LX of action further to amend the Maharashtra Stamp Act, for the purposes
1958. hereinafter appearing;
(%)
"I 3ME-9?—2


Admin
Stamp


Al

Short title

HERT A AU AWTERTT VAT TS, ATFIA 0¥, 09%/AMIa" 33, IH ¥

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (/)

of article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Maharashtra is
hereby pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance, namely :—

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Maharashtra Stamp

and (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024.

commencement.

Amendment of
SCHEDULE I
of LX of 1958.

2) It shall come into force at once.
2, In SCHEDULE I appended to the Maharashtra Stamp Act,—

(1) in article 4, in column (2, for the words “One hundred rupees”
the words "Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(2) in article 5, in clause (), in sub-clause (B), in column (2, for
the words "One hundred rupees” the words “Five hundred rupees” shall
be substituted;

() in article 8, in column (2), for the words “One hundred rupees”
the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(4) in article 9, in column (2), for the words “One hundred rupees”
the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(9) in article 10, in column (2), for the figures, words and letters
0.2 per cent. on share capital or increased share capital, as the case
may be, subject to a maximum of Rs. 50,00,000", the figures and words
“0.3 per cent. on share capital or increased share capital, as the case
may be, subject to a maximum of rupees One Crore” shall be substituted;

(6) for article 12, the following article shall be substituted,
namely :(—

“12. AWARD, that is to say,
any decision in writing by
an arbitrator or umpire, on
a reference made otherwise
than by an order of the Court
in the course of a suit, being
an award made as a result
of a written agreement to
submit present or future
differences to Arbitration
but not being an award
directing partition,—

(a) relating to immovable The same duty as is leviable
property; on a conveyance under
clause (b) of article 25.

(2

LX of
1958.


Admin
Stamp


T

theTAXtal®

HENTE ITHA AT SFATIRU W 375, AT ¥, 0¥/3AMVaT R, FH Y%

(b) relating to movable
property,—

(i) where the amount 0.75 per cent. of the amount
granted in the award, granted in the award.
does not exceed
rupees fifty lakhs ;

fii) where the amount Rupees thirty seven
granted in the award, thousand five hundred plus
exceeds rupees 0.5 per cent. of the amount

fifty lakhs but does granted in the award.
not exceed rupees
five crores;

(iii) where the amount Two lakhs sixty two
granted in the award, thousand five hundred
exceeds rupees rupees plus 0.25 per cent.
five crores; of the amount granted

in the award. 7;

(7 in article 27, in column (2), for the words “rupees one hundred” the
words “rupees five hundred” shall be substituted;

(8 in article 30, in column (2, for the words “One hundred rupees” the
words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(9 in article 38, in column (), for the words “One hundred rupees” the
words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(10 in article 44, in column (2), for the words “One hundred rupees”
the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(11) in article 47, in clause (1), in sub-clause (b), in column (2), for the
words “fifteen thousand" the words “fifty thousand” shall be substituted;

(12 in article 49, in column (2, for the words “One hundred rupees”
the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(13) in article 50, in column (2, for the words “One hundred rupees”
the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(14) in article 52, in clause (a), in column (2), for the words “Two
hundred rupees” the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(15) in article 58, in clause (a), in column (2), for the words "Two
hundred rupees” the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(16) in article 63,—

(i) in clause (a), in column (), for the words “ten lakh” the words
“five lakh” shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (b),—

(A) in column (f), for the words “ten lakh” the words “five
lakh” shall be substituted;

(B) in column (2), for the figures and words “0.1 per cent. of
the amount above rupees ten lakh” the figures and words “0.3 per
cent. of the amount above rupees five lakh” shall be substituted.


Admin
Stamp


_

—

theTAXta}

FERTE JEA TAYS AWTIROT WAT A1, A(FEET ¥, 0%/ 3Mya 3, TH WS

STATEMENT
With a view to bring simplicity and uniformity in levy of stamp duty

and to increase the Government revenue, it is proposed to amend certain
articles of Schedule I appended to the Maharashtra Stamp Act (LX of 1958).

2. The salient features of the proposed amendments to the said Act

are as under :—

(/) to increase rate of stamp duty fixed long ago at the nominal
amount of rupees hundred or rupees two hundred on certain
instruments specified in articles 4, 5, 8, 9, 27, 30, 38, 44, 49, 50, 52 and
58 to rupees five hundred;

(i) to increase rate of stamp duty and maximum limit of rate of
stamp duty on the instrument of articles of association of a company
specified in article 10;

(111) to increase rate of stamp duty on the instrument of award by
arbitrator specified in article 12;

(/v) to increase the maximum limit of rate of stamp duty on the
instrument of partnership, where share contribution brought in by way
of cash is in excess of rupees 50,000, specified in article 47;

(v) to increase the rate of stamp duty and maximum limit of
rate of stamp duty on the instrument of works contract specified in
article 63.

3. As both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session and the

Governor of Maharashtra is satisfied that circumstances exists which render
it necessary for him to take immediate action further to amend the
Maharashtra Stamp Act, for the purposes aforesaid, this Ordinance is

promulgated.
Muinbai, C. P. RADHAKRISHNAN,
Dated the 14th October 2024, Governor of Maharashtra.

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJESH KUMAR,

Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

09

SN T 1 I, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLLCE\"I‘ION.
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUB]-!AE%?{RSNAg.P%gi?giﬁgﬁg.
MUMBAL 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATION 3

21.A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


Admin
Stamp


